
ISH6 Pt3 

 
0:02 
Good afternoon, Excuse me, good afternoon. Time is now 2:00 and we will, I'm going to go through 
the action points from this morning's hearing. 

 
0:16 
There are 11 points that we've noted. So Action .1, Agenda Item 3 Strategic matters. 

 
0:25 
Provision of a supplement to the applicants transcript of IS H1 to include the correct references and 
that's the Applicant A deadline 3 which is the 3rd of May 2024 

 
0:42 
Item 2 

 
0:43 
Who's agenda item 3. Strategic matters Provision of the Court Judge Judgement Ross versus Secretary 
of State, 2020 EW HC226 and that's the applicant IT Deadline 3. 

 
0:59 
Action .3 Agenda Item 3. Strategic Matters 

 
1:03 
provide the relevant extracts from the Tilbury 2 application that amplifies the distinction between port 
development and the associated development, and that's the applicant at Deadline 3. 

 
1:16 
Action .4 Agenda Item 3. 

 
1:20 
Strategic Matters 

 
1:22 
A written response to the Question on Climate Change Greenhouse Gas Assessments and that was for 
the Applicant Deadline 3. 

 
1:32 
Action .5 Agenda Item 4. Climate Change 

 
1:36 
Clarification on the additional landslide components that would require consent 

 
1:42 
that would be required in order to fulfil the additional capacity of liquid bulk imports. And that's the 
applicant at Deadline 3 



 
1:53 
Action .6 Agenda Item 5. Decommissioning 

 
1:57 
response to the query regarding possible future baseline in relation to potential future ecology and 
landscape that has developed over the 25 year. 

 
2:08 
That's the applicant at Deadline 3. 

 
2:13 
Action .7. Agenda Item 5 on Decommissioning provide the detail of how decommissioning was 
described in the Scoping Report, and that's for the applicant at Deadline 3. 

 
2:27 
Action .8. Agenda Item 5. Decommissioning 

 
2:31 
and it's regarding the Queens row properties. Add a note to the to that that was discussed at IH6 
regarding the potential situation at the point of decommissioning and how the properties will be 
treated and that's the applicant deadline 3. 

 
2:49 
Action .9 Agenda Item 6. Socioeconomic effects. 

 
2:55 
This action point is for Nelk and we believe they made a note of it. It's for the the loss of the Queens 
Road properties and the impact on the local housing stock. 

 
3:06 
And again, that's for Nelk. Deadline 3. 

 
3:12 
Action .10 Agenda Item 6. Socioeconomics 

 
3:18 
A Note on the Cumulative Impacts of the Railroad Scheme and Viking 

 
3:24 
Scheme in relation to private rental housing. 

 
3:27 
And that's for the applicant deadline. Three or four wasn't confirmed. So if that could be confirmed, 
which deadline that's coming in at Please 



 
3:39 
Action .11 Agenda Item 6. Socioeconomic Effects 

 
3:45 
Provision of the Plan and Explanatory notes that's been produced by Gately Hammer Hammer The 
applicants land agents regarding the private roads within the order limits. That's applicant at deadline 
three and that concludes the action points. Thank you. 

 
4:02 
Are there any questions Harry would fill? But on behalf of the applicant, no questions, ma'am. Just to 
pick up two points, First of all, in terms of the appropriate deadline for item 10 and can I take that 
away and perhaps come back to it as an AOB item on Thursday, so we can clarify which deadline that 
would be? Umm. And then the only other point is in relation to your third item in terms of Tilbury 2, 
the way that was 

 
4:34 
characterises that it would amplify the the distinction. I think it might be better put as illustrate rather 
than amplify having regard to the the, the level and extent of the reasoning. It's an illustration as 
opposed to something which will give you chapter and verse just to manage expectations in that 
respect. Thank you, Mr Philpott, I've changed that and I've made a note about the any other business 
for Thursday. Thank you. 

 
5:04 
Thank you for that, Miss McHugh. 

 
5:06 
Think that probably moves on to item number 9. Any other business? Unless there's something that 
you need to. 

 
5:14 
I guess so. I do apologise. I I'm reminded correctly 

 
5:20 
by Mr Rahul that there was also we agreed that we would provide a note in terms of the question of 
retrofitting that arose. I think this was under, I think this was under either Item 3 or may or may have 
arisen under climate change an Item 4. But it was in relation to the potential for use of the jetties 
infrastructure in future for some other product as a result of retrofitting. And I do recall we said 

 
5:52 
they would provide a note on that. And I I think that may be whether that's item 12 on the list, but I 
think that that would be appropriately captured. 

 
6:02 
That's fine. Thank you for that. We'll we'll pick that one up in in those notes. 

 
6:07 
We have no other business. Is anything else in the applicant that you used to raise? No, thank you, Sir. 



 
6:13 
And I don't think there's anybody online to, 

 
6:15 
to check with. So no that that's fine. I think that just leaves us then to sort of move on to to the close 
of the hearing. So thank you for your participation today. And as I mentioned, there'll be digital 
recording will be put up on the website as soon as practical after we close. And in addition, if you 
could submit points that you've made by deadline 3, which is the 3rd of May 2024 and the time is now 
just after 5 past two and I declare this issue specific hearing closed. So good afternoon. Thank you 
very much. 

 
6:43 
 


